
Fiction  Non-Fiction 
I wonder how that 
happened? 

What was it that __ did that 
was special? Did this help 
people? How? 

I wonder if that was a good 
choice? 

What was your favorite 
thing about __? 

What do we know so far? Did ___ work hard to gain 
their skill? 

I wonder what is going to 
happen next? 

Did ___ ever make big 
mistakes? 

What do you think might 
happen? 

What challenge did ___ run 
into? Did they 
overcome/get past those 
challenges? 

Do you think that was the 
best outcome/ending? 
What would have been a 
better outcome? 

If you were ____ would you 
have done anything 
differently? 

I wonder what would have 
happened if. . . ? What do 
you think? 

Do you think ____’s 
challenges were challenges 
most people face/deal 
with? Why do you think 
they had different 
challenges? 

What lesson do you think 
this folktale/story was trying 
to teach? Is this a lesson 
we find valuable in our 
home? Why or why not? 

What did you learn from 
____? Would you like to 
know more about them? 

 

 


